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GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT

REGULAR BOARD MEETING AGENDA
July 22, 2014

6. BUSiNESS

Agenda Item 6 - B: Accept Bid No. 1306 - Food Services Supplies

Requests for bids were sent to 28 qualified vendors for a lotal of 90 Food
Services Supplies. Attached is a list of the item numbers 10 be awarded to
vendors and a summary of the bids received. The bid specifications and
conditions contain provisions to extend the contract for up 10 two additional
years, one year at a time. Sales tax is to be added. Bids are on file in the
Purchasing Department

It Is recommended that the Board accept the bids for Food services Supplies
from Daxwell, Nesaj Disposables, P & R Paper Supply Co., and Southwest
School and Office Supply as lhe low qual1fylng bids meeting specifications,
terms, and conditions of Bid No. 1306 as shown on the attached list.

On motion of Trustee ~~ deC[}flded by Trustee ~d ,
and /Ill 1J.Jl( Mrf7!,.~ tP.A , the Board of Education
accepted 1he bids for FoOd ervices Supplies from Daxwell, Nosa] Disposables, P & R
Paper Supply Co., and Southlvesl School and Office Supply as the low qualifying bids
meeting specificatIons, terms, and conditions of Sid No. 1306 as shown on the attached
list.

Agenda Item 6 - B



.... GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL OISTRICT
FOOD SERVICE SUPPLY BID NO. 1306, '

j
AGENDA ITEM - 2014/15
FOOD SERVICES SUPPl.IES

-

NO~NO BID

NQ.~O~

NOBID~Bt.Q_

NOBrD i NOBID

NOBfD I NOBIO

NOBID .....!:!..~BrD_

N0.!!!Q..---!::!.O B1Q._

NOBID NOBID

NOBID ......!:!Q.B!!!..-

~- -!:!Q-~~.
NOBID NOBID

I •
NOBID NOBID

$5588

$29,26

$63.03 NOBID

$30.53

$88.70

NOBID

NO BID

NOBID

NO~

S20.75

NO BID

NO BID NO BID _Nq, BID_

$67.80 I NOBID__--!:!~B~D

NOBID NOBID NOBID

NOBtD NOBID! NO~

_NO~

$24.20

NOBID

NOBID

NOBID

NOBID

NO''''

NO BID

NO BID$28.90"

Sp.95"

P & R PAPl"R SOUTH'.'IEST SYSCO UMPAK WALLACE

NOBIO NOBIONO BID

----

NOBID

NOBID NOBID N?.!llQ....

NOBID NOBID ~I.Q.....

.~ .~$19.10" NOBID $25.33 NOBIO I _N~

NOBID I N9~ ~q BID $33.85" I NOBID NO_~ ~ ~...!:!O B~

N9BID NOBID NOBID $17.55' NOBID $26,47: NO_BIO~'!Jr~

NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.50" ~~. NOBID NOBID N? BID.

'0"0 '0"0 '0"0 "~O "0 fO "0 '0"0 '0"0
NO BID NOBID NO_BID~.30" NO BID NO~~ ~Bl..Q ~B~

$36.32
NOBID I NO_~lq NO BID SSll.oo. NO BID (a) ~ ~IQ....

NOBID I NOBID NDBI~ NOBID $28.00' NOBID W1.18 NOBID N~.!i.D
I

_ ~~D._~O.BIO NO BID ~

NOBID I NO810 ~ NO810

~.~ i t.:l0BID NOBID NOBID $33.95' I NOBID

50

25

50

300

200

.00

'00

'00

NOBID

30 t.'.0 "D.
50 _ NOBID.

100 NOBID

__ '_00 NOBID

PKG

BOX

PACK

CASE

CASE

CASE;

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE
I

CASE

CASE

CASE

**
**

I
I

~~OBID NOB.!Q..~l? $10,75' NOBID

100 t.:l£.BID1:oB1D NOBIl? NOBIDI. $7.50" ~ NO BID

100 NOBID
4

NO~ NOBIl? ~$7.50" NOBID

** CASE .,~ NOBID Y.~I!IO sso.oo, NOBID $8~ __ NOBID

~~~~ _~_----L-NOBID NOBID N0!l2. !i0_BID $21.75" NO BID

** CASE, 250 NOBID NOBID NOBIO NOBID $21,95" NO BID----'"- --- ~-_.
NOBID NOBI~

-- f--
ICASE 100

;;;;-f-:. -L-_ -- ---

~

":~f-~_N~ ~O..!'D ~JIOBID $7.55' $7.110 $10.76 NOBtD NO~~_

CASE 120 I NOBID NOBID _~ _~ .....-J~~_~e.10 NOBID NOBID NOBID

,CASE f-- 8 _+NO BID I NOBID NOJ!!Q., NO~,9S" I $35,80 $71,80 NOBID NOBID

CASE 50___ @~~~BID I NOBID $12.95 ~, $11.GG' Sot3.n NOBID N<?~

I CASE 10 ~O~rNOBID NOBID i NOBID $2400 I $18,95' NOBID !!~BID NOBID

CASE 10 NOBID NO BID I NO BID I NOBID $2400 $23,75"' $<4~.51~~~~

:CASE 10 I 1-'==-1 '
_ .___ __ NOBID NOBID NOBID I NOBtD $2400 $15.25" $23.13 NOBID NOBID

CASE 10 :-",!OBID: ND.B.!Q...f-.!!~::~D NOBI:O -----.E!.~5" $21.90 $24.71~BtO ---.!:!Q.BIi2-

PKG 1~ I_..!'!9..-BlD_~~~~D NOBID __Sot 80" $5.15 $7,72 NOBID NOBID

~ _ ~ .-!:!2. BID I NOBID: NOBID I $480" S5 15 $797 NOBID ':10BlD_.

50 ~' ~~D I NOBID ..~$980' $1000 $1770 NOBIO NO BID

7 NOBID N9~~lD ...!:!.~BID-+---E2~~,~ ~OO ....!::!9BIQ.~~.I~

20 NOBID_ NOBID NOBID NOBID $20.05 $1~,30" $9.2.50.~ J'!Q.!IQ
lU5 $1UO

CASE 300 NOBID NO810 NOBID NOBID (l1l5e1lK) ~.J.lJ~:"an) $<43.88 NO610 NO810

EACH > ltt';;fBID' NOBID NOBID NOBtD $1,17 (contlnenlal) $ 58/a) NOBID N9_'OD-- ~-f--- -- "= . -
** PKG 1~ NOBIO Nl?~ _'_O_~B~..!:!?BID $\4.00 $13.75 ~2~6!.. ~OB!Q..~E!:Ii2-

CASE.~ toll?BID ,NO BJO NO810 $14~.OO' $172.00 NOBIO NOBID NOBID ~D_

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Bogs,PrintedFoll ChickenBag

Bags, piest!l:, (Fits i2-16 gal), 24"x33" 1000lcs
I~

911050
24

1_ DISTRlC1

NUMBER

'911061 Bov.1,lid. Micro, 160z., 500fcs
2?~

911065 Bowls, While Slyro, 120z, l00D/es.

;~ 911072 Bowl, Micro, 160z" 6lal:k, 500lcs

1..17..
91{073 Container, Micro P8n, -I pI" OraQon(Take Out)

.1.li-

22
9

~~10.74 C~tainer, Micro Pail, 1 pt., Pagoda (Talle Out)

91i075 COntainer, Bo)(,Plaid Paper, Pop up Box,
30 (Chidlen), SOOfcs,

911090 Container,Hinged,Clear,&OZ,(square)4110el
31 I (400Ies)

I":::':" 911096 Container, Clear, S8ndwlch wedge, 25011:$
32

I~ 911097 Container, Clear, HoaglelSub Sand. 21125c1

3.l. =-:-7 = (250fcs)
911100 Container, Hinged, CI:a\r box, 9xa.3"deep,

1.1! ;.;-;-:-;-;:::-~.elaQL~-L5gJ25OJCS
911121 Container, Round, Blal:k w/clear hinged lid, r i f.CASE

I~=~~.. I -911125 Container, Hinged. SllyO, 3comp., 200lcs CASE' 10
1~;;;7. ... I NOBID ....!:!O.!'ID NOBID NO BID ' $13.75" _~.

911129 Cup, Insert, Parfait, 1000/1:5,(must fil12 & 20 1- ** -lcASE 100
37 ;;-:";.:..-;;-o.z,_cypl ,_, NOBID i NOBID NO~IQ.1:!2....B.!.D~~~

38911130 Cup,Paper,Cold 12o.z,251pkg~100!c:s. '** leASE 20 NOBID NO~f-!:!9-~I.Q. ~ ~" •. l NOBID

""91'1135 Cup, Partait, 120z" 20!pl(@50/cs(domerid mIIst *~~ ----;-0 I
39 fit) ,_._NOBl_D __ NOBID NOBID NOBID $48.00' ,NeelD

-91-115OCUp,Parfalt,90z.,(BFK)201pk@J50/cs.(dOme **' - ---.
40 ~dmuslfrl) " ICASE 10 N081D +!!.~BID_ NOBID_ NOBID $<42,55" 1 NDBID

911151 Cup, Lid w/Slot for Parfails, 9,12, 200z" lm/cs ** F'
41 CASE 5 NOBID' NOBID NOBID NOBID 21.&5" I NOBID

--'-'"60 C"P, Ud, Portio" "', 25Jpk,@.00I~.M," fil -~l-- .
.~'="."65 20z portlonC\Jp I.CASE _~_N~ NOBID I~O_B.!Q.. N:OBID $18.95'

Cup, Lid, Portion, 4oz, 25pkg@100cs • - t-:
43 ,CASE 15 NO'!!.O----+--!.NOBID : NOBID 1 NOBID $28,SO" i

911170 Clip, Dome lid l00IPkQC!;l10fcs. Mustfi!9,12&1 ** -r- I I
4-4 20 oz. shaker C\Jn CASE 100 NOBID I NOBID I NOBID I NO BID $35.00"

~ ClEANING SUPPLIES;

1 901005 Bleach,6/g81.

o. - 901010 C1earler.Alkali Remover, Mgal.
2

901015' Scrubber, Brillo Pads, 12f15 pad ems/case
3

-- 901020 Oeaner, Degrease!",41gBI,
I-=--- 901025 Cleaner,Glass,Aerosol, 12f190z.

5
901030 Cleaner, ~n, Spray cans, 12/18oz.

6=.
901035 Cleaner, Stainless Steel, Spray 6Il60z.

....1..-,901040 Cleanser, Oxygen.Bleach (PoWder). 241210z,

I.....!.- 901045 'Gloves~ Rubber, Lrg, 12prlpkg.,
901050 Gloves,Rubber. Me<:!.12prlpkg

"1-:':::""901065 IScrubber, Pad Green, 10Ibx@61cs.

11'=A
-'2 901070' Scrubbel'$, Stainless Steel, 12lbox@6Jes

- 901080 SOaP.Laundry Detergent, 50# box
,>3
,- 901085 Soap, Pink Uq.Detergent, 4/gal

-'-'_._--
151901095 Spay Bollia Combo, Each 320:.

.. k901100 Towels, Bar-MOP Bdl, 36Jpkg, 14)(17••- 9011'05 ToWels,DisPOsable.VVhite,1200fcs,,'~L---:-.-
: CONTAINERSfWRAPS:

;6~"0~10 Bags, Cover for Racks, 52"x80", SOles

-- 911015 Bags. Fo~,Cheese burger, 6x7

"~ 9i 1025 Bags, FoR,HambUrger. 6x7

.1
0

911045 Btlgs,lunCh,waxed,'tttlile or clearwlprtnlFresh-
_2_'~_ .. ~OOOIes6#.

BIlg!I,PrinledFoil HoldogBlIg

"Denotes low bid
(e) Does not meet specffic:ations Prepared by Gan:len Grove USO 81612014 Page 1



, , .•~~
GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTR!CT

FOOD SERVICE SUPPLY BID NO. 1306

"

DlSTR1C ITEM DESCRIPTION SA.M:LE* PACK APPA:OXlMJ!l,Tf. CH~~~~ DAXWELL ~~L~~ NOW P'" A: PAPER SOUTHWEST SYSCO UNIPAK WALLACE

931050 Utensils, Knive, Blaek H.D. lOOO1case

-:: 1931055 LJiensils, Soup SPOOrlS,Black H,D, lOOO/case

-rs31060 Utensils, Fof1(s, Black H.D 1000/cs
alL-
90 1931065 Utensils, Spoons, Blaek, H.D. 1ooo1es

$1.8M-

$18.SO

SIB.50

SIB.5O

NO BID

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID_

NOBID

NOBID

NO BID

NOBID

NOB.!Q...

$25,SO

$2,S.5O

$25.SO

S25.so.

NOBID

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

NO BID

!'I~ _NQJ!!!L
NO BID! NO BID

$6.(.16
$13.73

"J

$46.20

$27,73

$2".82

$33.51

m.24

"'_M

$230.381 NO BID

NOBID NOBtD

NOBID NOBID

NO BID N9 BID NO B!Q_

$33.52 I "!~ ~B!Q_

NO BID NOBID NO BID

NOBID Nt?~ ~BtD

NOBID~I~~_

NO BID NOBID; N_O.B.!Q....

N~BIO NOBID

NO BID

I $18~1

i SI~.9$ NO BID i NO BID

J NO BID , NO BID I NO.mQ...

INOBtD NOBID! NDB.!Q....

I I
$26.36 NO 810 $16,90

$18,55_ $29.03

$.16.S5

$IB.55

$32.~

$18.55

$81.00'

531.~_

$043,74

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

NO BID $58.IM---;-

NOBID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NOBID ,~~D...!!P-J.~

NOBIO 1$.(1.24 NOBID' NO.mQ.....

NOBID

NO BID

NOBID

NOBID

,_NOBID

$63,00"

$19.90'

$13.85'

$21.9's'

$17,4S'

525.40'

$22.4,S'

$43.00'

$17..(5'

$66.40'

$15.95'

$19.0~'

$52.00'

$17..(5'

$1~.~

$31.0S'

$1S.90'

537.25'

NOBID

NOBID

NO BID

NOBID

NOBID NOBID

NOBID NO BID

NOBlD NOBID

NOBID NOBID

NO BID NO BID

NOBID NOBID

NO BIQ.. !!l? BID

NOBID NOBlD

NOBID NOBID

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $3l\,5O'

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

NOytD

NO BID

NO~ NO~.!:i9_~D

N0!l!Q.... _NO BID NO BID
;

NO BID

NOBID

N_OB!!?_ !l0 BID ' NO BID

__NO~ ~O BID NO BID

NO BID I NO BID' NO BID

I NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID

f'!OBID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID __

NOBID

NO BID

NOBtD

NO BID

~~
NO BID

NO BID
$14.1B(2 PaUel!

Min) (a)

NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID $lUS'

NOBID N0l!l.Q......!:!?BID NO BID I $21.9S'

_ ~ NOBID ~_NOBtDI $10$.00'

NO BID NO~ _Nq~q,BID I $66.00-

NOBID NO BID NO BID ...t!£-BID $.(3.00'

__ ,__ NOB~~I..!:!-0BID

NOBID NO BID NO BID

a

15

500

250

'000

'00

'00

'50

NO_~~_BIO

--
100 I NOBID NOBIO NOBID NOBID $35,45'

"'~ _ NO BID NO-'~!Q...~ BID ~ B~ $16.95"

3 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBIDi $lB.'sO'

200 ~I~ N~B~ N~..!'IOBIDI $1B5O'

'H;NO_B~ ----.!'.;IQ,~_"!.OBID NOBID! $19 SO'

100 ~D._ ~l? NOBlD NOBID _ $1850'

30 NOBID NO~ NOBID NOBID $8700CASE,

CASEI

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CAS~~ NQBIO NOBID NO BID I
CASt~~B.~~~?BID NO BID

CASEI 100 NOBID f NOBIl? . NO BID 'NO BID

CASEI 400

_~ ROLL

ROLL.

**

**

** CASE
I

9500

** CASEI 5000

o:sE1- 3
----t------
CASEI 2500

** ~~rt;
CASEI 50

** CASEI 40

** ~-' .2~_

** CASEI 250

** CASE]

** CASE!----;

** CASE 250
----
** CASE

**

**

**

**

**

** CASE 20--- --
** CASE 5

CASE
I

ROLLI 100 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $8.90' NO BID $16.33 NOBIO NO_B_'O
-+---c--c -- I----" -- -

ROLL ~~ _.~OBlD ~~_ NOBID ~~9.~ NOBID _~~~ _.!!Q!!Q...

ROLL ~_ L-_~ _~' ~O;O BID, $1'OS' NO~ ~~~ ---!'O~
__ ~IR :---~5 I NO BID NO~ NOBID _~OBID $.(2's' NOBID $15.2". N9~-.!!2~

PAIR i 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S3 fl.4 $1:30"_ NO:~IO NO'BID NO BID
** 1-- --

CASE! 100 NO BID NQ.!!!Q...L..!::!2-Bll:)o.!!-Q.BID $14S5' $13.99/8\ $20,5.B NO BID . NOBID

** CASEI 15 NOBID NOBIO NOBID .!:!2...~ID $14.'s5' $13.';l9(1l\ $20.63: NO BID I NO BID -

** ~CASE, 5600 NO BID $10.01' NOBI~ NOBID $10,70 $14.~!l_ $22.00 NOBID $10.31

** CASE) 10 NO BID I NOBlD NOB!l:l'. ~.B1D ----!!!:.5s:.-1 $13.~~ E!!:.1l3 NOBID NO BID

** CASE! 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID ~ S14.55' $13,99(1l) $20.G~!:!2.!'IlQ. NO BID

** ICASEI 10 _J'l~_ NOBIO NOBID NOBID $3(I.2S' NOBID~ 'NOBID NOBID ~ NO BID_

** CASE 5

._ CASE~ 500

** C;~30

Utensils, Sch Kits, Lt wt Spark, Straw, Napkin,
tOOD/es.
Utensils, Spoons, Soup, H.D., Clear tOOOles.

Cup, Soup, 12 oz combo wilh lid, paPer, 250/cs
PRINTED WITH .Hearty~.

931030 Cup, Soup, 16 oz combo with ~d, paper, 250/cs
PRINTED WITH "Hearty Soup'

931040 Plate, 9" Black, 500/es

931045 Prate, 9" 3-comp, Blad<.,500lcs

83

"

i SUPPLIES, MISL.
-- 921015- Fa_II,Roll, Heavy Duty, .001 18"x l00d

"0=-651921020 Fon, Roll, ughl WI., .007 lS"x1000'

-~:921031 IGloves, Vinyl. Small, Powder Free
66 l100Jbxi!X!101es

-~- 9'2"1032 Gloves, Vinyl, Med, Pow(iilrFree loolbx@10/es

J)7 ~~
921033 Gloves, Vmyt, L.arge, Powder Free

...Q!- :=:-.:::- ~~1.O/es
921034 Gloves, Vinyl, XL.aroe, Powder Free

~

' ~_'oW"
921040 Halmets,- 81k,Siring Net, (Cellucap),

70 ,;;;;T ~IbX@!.OIes
921055 Napkins, 'Nhile, 1ply Dispenser, 20 pkgJes

71
----e21060 Pan Uners, Pan::hmenl, 16 3f8x24 318, lOOO1es.

72 0=921065 Wrap, PlasUc, 10xl 0 perferated, 1900/roll

.13 ;-....-;:
74 92f070 Wrap, Plastic, 14x14 perferated, 1200Jron

- 92'1080 Wrap, PlastiC, 18x2OOOftBox w/cutter

..2~ -:~
921085 POI-Holder, Mit!, 17", pair

26_ .-..7 ...-:-.921090 Pot Holder, Plm Handler w/strap, pair
77

~ 921100 Utensils, Forh, H:D., Clear, 1000/es,
7S

- 9'2'-'10 Ulensfts, Knives, H.C. Clear, 10oo/es.

l~m120

I-=~:~921125

921t30 Ulensils, Spoons, H.D., Clear, tooOles.
82

931025

NUMBER

451911180 iCup, Plastic, Portion, 20%, 2500/pkg@10Ics

~85 ~Pi8StiC, Portio;;, 40%, 2501pkg~10Ics.
461

:

j;'1191 CUp, Shaker (~Iad) 20 oz SOi01oOilics. (dome lid
47 must m)

- 911210 Tray, Paper, Boat, 2/1:, 6xB, 1OOO/C5,

~ =::-+911215 Tray, Styro, Vv'tIite,S-comp. SOOlc5.

~- - -:tray;5-comP B1acl<'.

4"911225 Tray, Foil, 2-eornp 1000les

-'L.--

~

'1230 Trey, Paper, Red Plaid, 5# Nested Csrry Out,

52 -;.~ ~IC$.
911235 Tray. Paper, Campus Calering, Nested Carry

53 I OulsaOles
911250" Wrap, Wax, Fresh Express, 12x12,

24_ ~ 1.909lbx@5/cs, _
911266 Wrap. FOil, Red Pepper, 5 pkg. of 500 per case

55
....:!:..J - ~'wri'i>.FOil,C~seburger 10.5 X 14

1=-'-wrap,-Riii, ChkXen 10.5 X 14
57

- -- - Wrap, Foil, Hamburger 10.5 x 14"

" I Wrap. FOil,Hot Dog 9X12"
.5!.l _

Wrap, Fo~, Maxiwrap

...QQ-
- - Wrap: Foil, redlbtuelGreen Delsgn

I-M... 911270 Wrap, Wax, Tissue, Fresh Express, 6" x10 314"
62

921010 wrap, Fon Cushion, 10 1/2")(14", 500/pkgcrJ5Jcs.

'Denotes low bid
(a) Does not meet specificaUons Prepared by Garden Grove USC 8.'61"2014 Page 2
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