

GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT  
REGULAR BOARD MEETING AGENDA  
July 22, 2014

6. BUSINESS

Agenda Item 6 -- B: Accept Bid No. 1306 -- Food Services Supplies

Requests for bids were sent to 28 qualified vendors for a total of 90 Food Services Supplies. Attached is a list of the item numbers to be awarded to vendors and a summary of the bids received. The bid specifications and conditions contain provisions to extend the contract for up to two additional years, one year at a time. Sales tax is to be added. Bids are on file in the Purchasing Department.

It is recommended that the Board accept the bids for Food Services Supplies from Daxwell, Nosaj Disposables, P & R Paper Supply Co., and Southwest School and Office Supply as the low qualifying bids meeting specifications, terms, and conditions of Bid No. 1306 as shown on the attached list.

On motion of Trustee Harder, seconded by Trustee Reed,  
and unanimously carried, the Board of Education  
accepted the bids for Food Services Supplies from Daxwell, Nosaj Disposables, P & R  
Paper Supply Co., and Southwest School and Office Supply as the low qualifying bids  
meeting specifications, terms, and conditions of Bid No. 1306 as shown on the attached  
list.

Agenda Item 6 - B

GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT  
FOOD SERVICE SUPPLY BID NO. 1306

AGENDA ITEM - 2014/15 FOOD SERVICES SUPPLIES													
DISTRICT NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	SAMPLE *	PACK	APPROXIMATE	CHURCHFIELD TRADING	DAXWELL	MELLO SMELLO	NOSAJ	P & R PAPER	SOUTHWEST	SYSCO	UNPAK	WALLACE
<b>CLEANING SUPPLIES:</b>													
1	901005 Bleach, 6/gal.		CASE	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.55 *	\$7.90	\$10.75	NO BID	NO BID
2	901010 Cleaner, Alkali Remover, 4/gal.		CASE	120	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$34.55*	\$38.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	901015 Scrubber, Brillo Pads, 12/15 pad ctrns/case		CASE	8	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.95*	\$35.80	\$71.80	NO BID	NO BID
4	901020 Cleaner, Degreaser, 4/gal		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.95	\$11.99*	\$43.77	NO BID	NO BID
5	901025 Cleaner, Glass, Aerosol, 12/19oz.		CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	\$18.95*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	901030 Cleaner, Oven, Spray cans, 12/18oz.		CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	\$23.75*	\$49.51	NO BID	NO BID
7	901035 Cleaner, Stainless Steel, Spray 6/16oz.		CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	\$15.25*	\$23.13	NO BID	NO BID
8	901040 Cleanser, Oxygen-Bleach (Powder), 24/21oz.		CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.55*	\$21.90	\$24.71	NO BID	NO BID
9	901045 Gloves, Rubber, Lrg. 12pr/pkg.		PKG	132	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.80*	\$5.15	\$7.72	NO BID	NO BID
10	901050 Gloves, Rubber, Med. 12pr/pkg.		PKG	144	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.80*	\$5.15	\$7.87	NO BID	NO BID
11	901065 Scrubber, Pad Green, 10/bx@6/cs.		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.80*	\$10.00	\$17.70	NO BID	NO BID
12	901070 Scrubbers, Stainless Steel, 12/box@6/cs		CASE	7	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.20*	\$28.66	\$30.00	NO BID	NO BID
13	901080 Soap, Laundry Detergent, 50# box		BOX	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.05	\$19.30*	\$92.50	NO BID	NO BID
14	901085 Soap, Pink Liq. Detergent, 4/gal		CASE	300	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.95 (Luseux)	\$11.80 (ultraclean)	\$43.88	NO BID	NO BID
15	901095 Spay Bottle Combo, Each 32oz.		EACH	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.17	\$ .90* (continental)	\$ 58(a)	NO BID	NO BID
16	901100 Towels, Bar Mop Bdl, 36/pkg, 14x17	**	PKG	150	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.00	\$13.75	\$32.63	NO BID	NO BID
17	901105 Towels, Disposable, White, 1200/cs.		CASE	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$149.00*	\$172.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>CONTAINERS/WRAPPS:</b>													
18	911010 Bags, Cover for Racks, 52"x80", 50/cs		CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.75*	NO BID	\$29.26	NO BID	NO BID
19	911015 Bags, Foil, Cheese burger, 6x7	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.50*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20	911025 Bags, Foil, Hamburger, 6x7	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.50*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
21	911045 Bags, Lunch, waxed, white or clear w/print Fresh Express, 1000/cs 6#.	**	CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$80.00	NO BID	\$85.45*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22	Bags, Printed Foil Hotdog Bag	**	CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.75*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
23	Bags, Printed Foil Chicken Bag	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.95*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
24	911050 Bags, Plastic, (Fits 12-16 gal), 24"x33" 1000/cs		CASE	25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.10*	NO BID	\$25.33	NO BID	NO BID
25	911061 Bowl, Lid, Micro, 16oz., 500/cs		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.85*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26	911065 Bowls, White Styro, 12oz, 1000/cs.		CASE	30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.55*	NO BID	\$26.47	NO BID	NO BID
27	911072 Bowl, Micro, 16oz., Black, 500/cs		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$39.50*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
28	911073 Container, Micro Pail, 1 pt., Dragon (Take Out)		CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.30*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
29	911074 Container, Micro Pail, 1 pt., Pagoda (Take Out)		CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.30*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
30	911075 Container, Box, Plaid Paper, Pop up Box, (Chicken), 500/cs.		CASE	400	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$56.00*	NO BID	\$36.32 (a)	NO BID	NO BID
31	911080 Container, Hinged, Clear, 6oz. (square) 4/10ct (400/cs)		CASE	300	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.00*	NO BID	\$48.18	NO BID	NO BID
32	911096 Container, Clear, Sandwich wedge, 250/cs		CASE	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.90*	NO BID	\$63.03	NO BID	NO BID
33	911097 Container, Clear, Hoagie/Sub Sand, 2/125ct (250/cs)		CASE	400	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.90*	NO BID	\$88.70	NO BID	NO BID
34	911100 Container, Hinged, Clear box, 9x8-3" deep, (Salad) 2/125ct (250/cs).		CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.95*	NO BID	\$55.88	NO BID	NO BID
35	911121 Container, Round, Black w/clear hinged lid, 7"		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$27.95*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
36	911125 Container, Hinged, Stryo, 3comp., 200/cs		CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.75*	NO BID	\$20.75	NO BID	NO BID
37	911129 Cup, Insert, Parfait, 1000/cs, (must fit 12 & 20 oz. cup)	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.20*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
38	911130 Cup, Paper, Cold 12oz, 25/pkg@100/cs.	**	CASE	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$77.50*	NO BID	\$87.80	NO BID	NO BID
39	911135 Cup, Parfait, 12oz., 20/pk@50/cs (dome lid must fit)	**	CASE	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$48.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40	911150 Cup, Parfait, 9oz., (BFK) 20/pk@50/cs, (dome lid must fit)	**	CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$42.55*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
41	911151 Cup, Lid w/slat for Parfaits, 9, 12, 20oz., 1m/cs	**	CASE	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.95*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
42	911160 Cup, Lid, Portion, 2oz, 25/pkg@100/cs. Must fit 2 oz. portion cup		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.95*	NO BID	\$24.20	NO BID	NO BID
43	911165 Cup, Lid, Portion, 4oz, 25/pkg@100/cs		CASE	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.50*	NO BID	\$30.53	NO BID	NO BID
44	911170 Cup, Dome Lid 100/pkg@10/cs. Must fit 9, 12 & 20 oz. shaker cup	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

\*Denotes low bid  
(a) Does not meet specifications

GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT  
FOOD SERVICE SUPPLY BID NO. 1306

DISTRICT NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	SAMPLE *	PACK	APPROXIMATE	CHURCHFIELD TRADING	DAXWELL	MELLO SMELLO	NOSAJ	P & R PAPER	SOUTHWEST	SYSCO	UNIPAK	WALLACE
45	911180 Cup, Plastic, Portion, 2oz, 2500/pkg@10/cs.		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.90*	NO BID	\$24.84	NO BID	NO BID
46	911185 Cup, Plastic, Portion, 4oz, 250/pkg@10/cs.		CASE	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.05*	NO BID	\$41.24	NO BID	NO BID
47	911191 Cup, Shaker (Salad) 20 oz Solo 1000/CS, (dome lid must fit)	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$66.40*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
48	911210 Tray, Paper, Boat, 2#, 6x8, 1000/cs.		CASE	400	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.85*	NO BID	\$18.61	NO BID	NO BID
49	911215 Tray, Styro, White, 5-comp. 500/cs.	**	CASE	9500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.80*	NO BID	\$18.96	NO BID	NO BID
50	Tray, 5-Comp Black.	**	CASE	5000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.80*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
51	911225 Tray, Foil, 2-comp 1000/cs		CASE	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$63.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
52	911230 Tray, Paper, Red Plaid, 5# Nested Carry Out, 500/cs.		CASE	2500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.85*	NO BID	\$28.36	NO BID	\$18.80
53	911235 Tray, Paper, Campus Catering, Nested Carry Out 500/cs	**	CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.95*	NO BID	\$64.16	NO BID	NO BID
54	911250 Wrap, Wax, Fresh Express, 12x12, 1000/bx@5/cs.		CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$106.00*	NO BID	\$13.73 (e)	NO BID	NO BID
55	911266 Wrap, Foil, Red Pepper, 5 pkg. of 500 per case	**	CASE	40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$66.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
56	Wrap, Foil, Cheeseburger 10.5 X 14	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
57	Wrap, Foil, Chicken 10.5 X 14	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
58	Wrap, Foil, Hamburger 10.5 X 14"	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
59	Wrap, Foil, Hot Dog 9X12"	**	CASE	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$52.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
60	Wrap, Foil, Maxiwrap	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$66.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
61	Wrap, Foil, red/blue/Green Delsgn	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
62	911270 Wrap, Wax, Tissue, Fresh Express, 6" x10 3/4"		CASE	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.50*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
63	921010 Wrap, Foil Cushion, 10 1/2"x14", 500/pkg@5/cs.		CASE	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00*	NO BID	\$86.88	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>SUPPLIES, MISL</b>												
64	921015 Foil, Roll, Heavy Duty, .001 18"x 1000'		ROLL	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.45*	NO BID	\$46.20	NO BID	NO BID
65	921020 Foil, Roll, Light Wt., .007 18"x1000'		ROLL	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.95*	NO BID	\$58.94	NO BID	NO BID
66	921031 Gloves, Vinyl, Small, Powder Free 100/bx@10/cs	**	CASE	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.50*	\$18.55	\$34.88	\$25.50	\$18.50
67	921032 Gloves, Vinyl, Med, Powder Free 100/bx@10/cs	**	CASE	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.50*	\$18.55	\$29.24	\$25.50	\$18.50
68	921033 Gloves, Vinyl, Large, Powder Free 100/bx@10/cs	**	CASE	250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.50*	\$18.55	\$29.03	\$25.50	\$18.50
69	921034 Gloves, Vinyl, XLarge, Powder Free 100/bx@10/cs	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.50*	\$18.55	\$29.82	\$25.50	\$18.50
70	921040 Hairnets, Blk, String Net, (Cellucap), 144/bx@10/cs		CASE	30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$87.00	\$81.00*	\$230.38	NO BID	NO BID
71	921055 Napkins, White, 1ply Dispenser, 20 pkg/cs.		CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.05*	\$32.06	\$33.51	NO BID	NO BID
72	921060 Pan Liners, Parchment, 16 3/8x24 3/8, 1000/cs.		CASE	500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.40*	NO BID	\$27.73	NO BID	NO BID
73	921065 Wrap, Plastic, 10x10 perforated, 1900/roll		ROLL	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.90*	NO BID	\$16.33	NO BID	NO BID
74	921070 Wrap, Plastic, 14x14 perforated, 1200/roll		ROLL	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.70*	NO BID	\$18.22	NO BID	NO BID
75	921080 Wrap, Plastic, 18x2000ft Box w/cutter		ROLL	8	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.05*	NO BID	\$35.60	NO BID	NO BID
76	921085 Pot Holder, Mill, 17", pair		PAIR	25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.25*	NO BID	\$15.20	NO BID	NO BID
77	921090 Pot Holder, Pan Handler w/strap, pair		PAIR	300	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.84	\$1.30*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
78	921100 Utensils, Forks, H.D., Clear, 1000/cs.	**	CASE	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.55*	\$13.99(a)	\$20.58	NO BID	NO BID
79	921110 Utensils, Knives, H.D. Clear, 1000/cs.	**	CASE	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.55*	\$13.99(a)	\$20.63	NO BID	NO BID
80	921120 Utensils, Sch Kits, Lt Wt Spork, Straw, Napkin, 1000/cs	**	CASE	5600	NO BID	\$10.01*	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.70	\$14.59	\$22.00	NO BID	\$10.31
81	921125 Utensils, Spoons, Soup, H.D., Clear 1000/cs.	**	CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.55*	\$13.99(a)	\$20.63	NO BID	NO BID
82	921130 Utensils, Spoons, H.D., Clear, 1000/cs.	**	CASE	30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.55*	\$13.99(a)	\$20.63	NO BID	NO BID
83	931025 Cup, Soup, 12 oz combo with lid, paper, 250/cs PRINTED WITH "Hearty Soup"	**	CASE	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.25*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
84	931030 Cup, Soup, 16 oz combo with lid, paper, 250/cs PRINTED WITH "Hearty Soup"	**	CASE	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.25*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
85	931040 Plate, 9" Black, 500/cs		CASE	500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.95*	\$31.42	\$33.52	NO BID	NO BID
86	931045 Plate, 9" 3-comp, Black, 500/cs	**	CASE	130	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.45*	\$43.74	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
87	931050 Utensils, Knife, Black H.D. 1000/case	**	CASE	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.45*	\$13.99(a)	\$17.56	NO BID	NO BID
88	931055 Utensils, Soup Spoons, Black H.D. 1000/case	**	CASE	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.45*	\$13.99(a)	\$26.99	NO BID	NO BID
89	931060 Utensils, Forks, Black H.D 1000/cs	**	CASE	1000	\$14.18 (2 Pallett Min) (a)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.85*	\$13.99(a)	14.26 (a)	NO BID	NO BID
90	931065 Utensils, Spoons, Black, H.D. 1000/cs	**	CASE	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.45*	\$13.99(a)	\$14.26(a)	NO BID	NO BID

\*Denotes low bid  
(a) Does not meet specifications