GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
REGULAR BOARD MEETING AGENDA
July 22, 2014

6. BUSINESS
Agenda ltem 6 —B:  Accept Bid No. 1306 — Food Services Supplies

Requests for bids were sent to 28 qualified vendors for a lofal of 90 Food
Services Supplies. Altached is a list of the item numbers lo be ewarded to
vendors and a summary of the bids received. The bid specifications and
conditions contain provisions to extead the centract for up fo two additional
years, one year at a time, Sales tax is to be added, Bids are on file in the
Purchasing Department.

It is recommended that the Board nccapt the bids for Food Services Supplies
from Daxwell, Noszj Disposables, P & R Paper Supply Co., and Southwest
Scheol and Office Supply as the low qualfying bids meeting specifications,
terms, and conditions of Bid No. 1306 as shown on the attached list.

On motion of Trustee ﬁ?ﬁﬁ%& D/s,ecc—nded by Trustee ﬁfﬁ[ ,
and 208 Gl L Mty g priend . the Board of Education

accepted the bids for Food Services Supplies from Daxwell, Nosa] Disposables, P & R
Paper Supply Co., and Southwest Schoot and Office Supply as the low qualifying bids
meeting specifications, terms, and conditions of Bid No, 1306 as shown on the attached
fist,

Agenda ltem 6 - B



GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
FOQD SERVICE SUPPLY BID NO. 1208

AGENDA ITEM - 2014715
FOOD SERVICES SUPPLIES
¢
oraTRICH ITEM DESCRIPTION BMPLE” | pac | aeprowmare | CHURCHIELD | payweys § MELCC | Nosau (P &R PAPER] SOUTKWEST | SYSCO | UMPAK | WALLACE
NUMBER
CLEANING SUPPLIES: ‘ ~ ]
y |Pe1005 Bleach, Sigal. CASE 200 NOBID NOBID | NOBID  NOBID| $7.55° $7.90 $10.75 | HOBID | NO BID
901044 |Cleaner, Alkall Remaver, 4/gat. CASE 120
2 " NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | §34.55 33810 |NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
901015 |Serubber, Brillo Pads, 12/16 pad ctns/cass CASE 8
3 . NQ BIO NCBID | NOBID ] NODID | $33.45° $35.80 $71.80 | NOBID | ROBID
901020 |Cleaner, Degreaser, 4/gal CASE 50
4 . NO BID NOBID  NOBID, NOBID| 31205 ; $11.99° |$4377 | NOBID | NOBID |
901025 [Cleaner, Glass, Aerosol, 12/1902. CASE 12
5 NO BID NOBID j NOBID | NOBID | $24.00 $12.85° |NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |
901030 [Cleaner, Oven, Spray cans, 12/180z. CASE 10
6 NO BID NGBID | NOBID | NOBID| $24.00 [ $23.757 | $48.51 | NOBID | HNOGID
901035 |Cleaner, Stainfess Steel, Spray 6/160z. CASE 19 [ |
7. i NQ BIS NOBID | NOBID ! NOBID| $24.00 §15.25* | $23.13 | NOBID | NOBID
901040 'Cleanser, Oxygen-Bleach (Powder), 24/210z, CASE 10 r
8 : 1 NogD NOBID | NOBID } NOBID [ _$21.55% $21.00 | $24.71 ; NOBID | NOBID |
901045 |Gloves, Rubber, Lrg, 12pripkq. PKG 122
9 . | . NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $4.80° $5.15 $7.72_| NOBID | NOEID
901050 |Gloves Rubber, Med. 12pripkg. PKG 144 ' N i
10 _ NOERID _ | NOBID { NOBID | NOBID |  $4.80° $5.15 $7.87 | NOBID | NOBID
501065 1Scrubber, Pad Green, 10/ox@6ics. CASE 50 j !
1 } NO BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID| $9.80° 51000 |s$12.70 | NOBID | NOBID
1 | 901070 | Scrubbers, Steiniess Steel, 12hox@6ice CASE 7 noBo | womo | woBiD | nomol s22z200 | szess | sie0 | womin| NOBD |
9019080 |Secap, Laundry Detargent, S5G# box BOX 20
13 NOBID _| NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | 520.05 $19.30° | §52.50 | NOBID ; NOBID
A01985 | Soap, Pink Lig.Detergent, 4/gal CASE 200 ! 14.85 $11.80
14 ) NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID{ (tuseuxy | (uftraciean) | $43.88 | NOBID ; NO BID
501095 |Spay Botlle Combo, Each 320z, EACH 10 e
15 - ™ NG BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| 5147 | (continenial) | § 5B(s) | NOBID | NOBID
901160 [Towels, Bar Mop Bd), 36/pkg, 14x17 dede PKG 150
L) | .. " NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID! $14.00 $13.75 | 33283 | NOBID | NOBID
901105 | Towels, Disposable, Whita, 1200/cs. CASE 20
17 A 1__nosmD NOBID_| NOBID | $149.00°| $172.00 NOBID |NOBID| NOBID | NOBID
CONTAINERS/WRAPS: y
911010 [Bags, Cover for Racks. 52'x80", 5dics CASE 100 T
a8 . NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $1075* NoBiD | $26.26 [ NO®ID | NOBID |
511015 |Bags. Foll, Cheese burger, 8x7 *k  |easE 100
9] . . _.NoBED NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $7.50 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
911025 |Bags, Foll, Hamburger, 6x7 **  |easE 100
20 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID, $7.50° NOBID INOBID| NOBID | NOBID
D11{45 |Bags. Lunch, waxed_ while or clear wiprnt Frash ** |cagE sa -
21 . _Expeess, 1000/cs 68, _ NOBID_ | NOBID | $80.00 | NOBID| $5545 NOBID jNOBID| NORID { NOBID
2 |23, Printed Foil Hetdog B8 *x |CASE 50 NoBID | NoBD [Noem jnomp| s2175 | nomb [NoBiD) noBib | wosi
2 Hags. Printed Foll Chicken Beg ** |CASE, 250 | nomp_ | Moo | OB |woBID| $2295° | NOBID |NOBID| NOBID| WOBID
911050 |Bags, Plastiz, (Fits 12-16 pal], 24"x33" 1000/cs. CASE: 25 i
24 . __Nos8ID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $19.70° HNOBID | 52533 | NOBID | NOBID
911081 | Bow, Lid, Micre, 18oz., 500/cs CASE 50
25 . s NO BID NOSID | NOBID | NOBID | $33.85° NOBID |NGEID| NOBID | NOBID
911065 |Bowis, While Styr, 1202, 1000/cs. CASE 20 .
26 [ NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID|  $17.55¢ NOBID | $2647 | NOBID | NOBID
811072 |Bowl, Micro, 160z., Black, 500/cs CASE‘ 50
27 . NOBID _| NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $38.50° NOBID _| NOBID| NOBID |_ NOBID
911073 | Container, Micro Pail, 1 pl.. Dragon {Take Out) CASE 100 .
28 . _NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $25.30 NOBID NOBID| NOBID | NOBID
911074 |Container, Micro Pail, 1 pt., Pagoda (Take Cut) CASE 160 ’
9 . NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $25.30 NOBID |NOBID| NOBID | NOBID
911075 [Container, Box, Plaid Paper, Pap up Box, CASE 400 $36.32
30| {Chicken), 500/cs, NO BID NOBID_| NOBID | MOBID |  $56.00° WO BID (& | NOBID | NOBID
'911090 |Comainer, Hingad, Clear, 6oz, (square) 4/10¢i CASE 200 ) '
ELl . __|tdo0ics) . N BID NOBID | NOBID | HOBID | $28.007 NOBID | 54818 | NOBID | NOBIC
911096 [Conlainer, Clear, Sandwich wedge, 250/cs CASE 200
2 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NQBID | $45.80" NOBID | $63.03 | NOBIDO | MOBID ]
911097 |Container, Clear, Hoagie/Sub Sand. 21 25¢t CASE 400
ekl __|r250/5) i _NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NO D | $28.90° NOBID | $88.70 | NOBID | NOBID
811100 |Contziner, Hinged, Clear box, 5x8-3"deep, CASE 100
34 {Salad) 21 25ct (250ics). NO BID HOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $3305 NOBID | $5586 | NOBID |_NO D )
611121 |Container, Round, Black wiciear hinged lid, 7° CASE 5 '
35 _NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | 827.95° NOBID [NOEID| NOBID | NOBIO |
911125 [Container, Hinged, Stryo, 3comp., 200/cs CASE 10
36 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID; $13.75" NOBID 52075 | NOBID | NOBID
211129 |Cup, Inser, Parfait, 1000/cs, {musi fit 12 & 20 *%  |oase 100
| oz cum NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $32.20° NOBID |NOBID| MOBID | NGBID
911130 |Cup, Paper, Coki 120z, 25/pkg@ 100/cs, **  |~acE 20 -
3B 1 } T NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| §77.50° NOBID | $87.60 | HOBID | NOBID
911135 [Cup, Parfait, 120z., 20/pkgh50/cs (dome fid must;  ww CASE 20
39 fit) - NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $48.007 NOBID | NOBID | NOBIO| NOBID
911150 |Cup, farall, S0z, (BFK) 20/pk@@ &0/cs. (dome ok 1CA5E 10 ’ ;
44 lig must fif} . i B HO BID NOBIE NOBID NOBID| 34255 NO®ID {NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
911151 |Cup, Lid wislat for Parfaits, 8,12, 20cz., tmfes ok |eacE 5 :
41 ! NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| 2185 NOBID  |NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
911160 |Cup, Lid, Portion, 2oz, Z5/pkg®100/cs, Must fit CASE 50 J
42 2 0z _portion cup NQ BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $18.95 NOBD_ | $24.20 | NOBID I NOBID
911165 |Cup, Ud, Portion, 40z, 25pkg@ 100cs "CASE 15 ' i h .
43 _ WOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID| $26.50° NOBRID | $30.52 | NOBID | NOBID
911170 |Gup, Dome Lid 100/pkg@+0/cs. Must il 8, 12 & wk  |~acE 100 ‘
44 20 oz shaker carp NOBID __+ NOBIC | NOBID | NOBID| $35.00° NOBID | MOBIO | NOBID | HOBID
“Denotes low bid
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{a} Does not mest specifications.



GARDEN GROVE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
FOOD SERVICE SUPPLY BIO NO. 1306

Y
Ve
sampLe® CHURCHFIELD MELLO
__|CisTRICT] ITEM DESCRIPTION . PACK | APPROXIMATE TRADING DAXWELL | ot o | NOSAJ | P& RPAPER SOUTHWEST | SYSCO | UNIPAK | WALLACE
_ |numeer
911180 |Cup, Plastic, Portion, 20z, 2500/pkg@10/cs. CASE 50 |
45 . N b NO BID NOBIO | NOBID [NOBID| $1800° | NOBID | 524.84 | NOBID; NORBID
'911188 [Cup, Plaslic, Portion, 40z, 250/pkgd 10/cs. C ASE‘ 20 .
46 . ] NQ BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | _$31.05% NOBID | $41.24 | NOBID | NOBID | |
911191 |Cup, Shaker {Salad) 20 oz Salo 1000/CH, (dome lid *%  |casE 100 !
A7 musi fit) NO BID NOBI} | NOBID | NOBID| 36640 NOBID [NOBID| NOBID [ NOBID |
911210 (Tray, Peper, Boat, 2%, 6xB, 1000/cs. CASE 400
48 ; , : NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| 51385 NOEID | %1861 | NOBID§ NOBID
49 11218 Tray, Styro, Whito, -camp. 500ics. **  |case 9500 NG BID noBiD | NoBID | noED!  $15800 NGBID | 51586 | NOBID | NOBID
50 Tray, 5-Comp Black. ** CasE| 5000 noaip | womi |noBiD |nomm| siseor | moBm | woeID! MOBID; NGBID
811225 Tray, Foil, 2-comp 1000/cs CASE 3 |
51 . NDBID NOBID | NOBID [NOBID| $63.00° NOBIQ  NOBID| NOGID, NOBID |
914230 [Tray, Paper, Red Plaid, 5# Nested Camy Out, CASE]' 2800
52 500/cs. NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID ,_ $14.85" NOBID | $28.3¢ | NOBID | 318.80
911235 |Tray, Paper, Campus Catering, Mested Carry *k  |onoe 10
53 Oul 500/kcs . . NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID [ $21.85° nosiD [ $64.16 | noBID | NoBID |
911250 |Wrap, Wax, Fresh Express, 12x12, CASE 50 $13.73
54 1000bx{R5/cs. : NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID;  $108.00° NO BID (@ | NOBID] NOBID
911286 |Wrap, Foil, Red Pepper, 5 pkg. of 500 per casa **%  |cacg 40 N .
55 - - . NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $BB.00* NOBD | wOBID| NOBID NO_E&J
' Wrap, Foil, Cheeseburger 10.5 X 14 o |case 269
56 | R NO D NOBIO | NOBID | NOBID | $43.00° NOBID | NOBID| NOBID | NOBID |
‘Wrap, Foil, Chicken 10.5 X 14 *h CASEl 250
57 _ NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $43.00° NOBID | NOBID| NGBID | NOBID
Wrap, Foil, Hamburger 10.5 X 14" *%  |onop 250
58 - NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $43.00* NOBID [ NOBID| NOBID! NOBID |
Wrap, Foil, Hot Dog 9x12" % (cacE 50
59 : | ._nNosip NOBIO | NOBID | NOBID | _$52.00 NOBID |MOBID| NOBID | NOBID |
‘Wrap, Foil, Maxiwrap *ek CASE 250
eof 1 . R M NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $65.00° NOBID | NOBIO| NOBID | NOBID
Wrap, Foil, red/btueiGreen Delsgn *%  |eag 250
61 . NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $43.00" NOBID | HOBKI) NOBID | NOBID |
911270 |Wrap, Wax, Tissus, Fresh Express, 6" x1G 347 CASE 8
62 : No eID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |  $36.50° NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NGO BID
621040 | Wrap, Foil Cushion, 10 1/2°x14", S500/pkg@5/cs. CASE 200
83, B . NQ BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID | $43.00° NoBID | sas.88 | MOBID | NOBID |
SUPPLIES, MISL
821015 |Foll, Roll, Heavy Duty, .001 18"x 1000 ROLL 100
64 N ; NOBID NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID| §3545* | NO®ID | $48.20 | NOBID| NOBID
gs 921020 Fol, R, "H"g_mf‘" 007 18751000 ROW, 80 NO BID NoBiD | NoBID [NomD| s6es | NOBD | ssap4 | NOBIDE NOBID
921031 |Gloves, Vinyl, Small, Fowder Free **  |oacE 3
65)  _|100mxfmi0ics NO BID NOBID | NOBID NOBID | _$18.50" $18.55 $34.88 | 852550 | $18.50
921032 |Glaves, Vinyl, Med, Powder Free 100/bx@ 10/cs ek CASE 200
67 NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $18.50° $10.55 $29.24 | 52550 | %18.50 |
921033 |Gloves, Vinyl, Large, Powdsr Fres **  |easE 250
68 100/bxd 10/cs NQ BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID]  $18.50° s18.55_ | 52003 | $25.50 | s18.50
921934 1Gloves, Vinyl, XLarge, Powder Free ** |oagE 100
69 100/bxdh1 Oics NOBID NOEID | NOBID | NOBID|  $18.50° $18.55 $20.82 | $25.50 | $18.50
921040 |Halmets, Bik, String Net, (Cellucag), CASE 20 |
7l [14smx@i0ics , NO BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID| $B7.00 $81.00° | $230.38] NOBID | NOBID_| |
621055 |Mapking, While, 1pty Dispenser, 20 pkgics. CASE 100 |
il 7 ) NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $18.405 $32.66 $33.51 | NOBID | NOBID |
8210680 |Pan Liners, Parchmenl, 16 3/8x24 3/8, 1000/cs. CASE 500
72 . X NOBID NOBID | NOEID | NOBID |  $25.40° NOBMD | $2773 ) NOBID | _NCBID
621065 |Wrap, Plaslic, 10x10 perferated, 1800/oll ROLL‘ 100
k1 | NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $8.80" NOBID | $16.33 | NOBID | MOBID
| 74 |921070 |Wrap, Plastic, 14x14 perferaled, 1200/ ROLL, 200 NO BID noBo | NoBID [ NoBiD|  $e70° NOEID | $1822 . NOBID | NOBID
521080 |Wrap, Plastic, 18x2000fl Box wicutter ROLL 8
R D v NO BID 'NOBID | NOBID , NOBID, %1105 NOBID | 53560 | NOBID | NOBID
921085 |Pal Holder, Mitl, 17, pair PAIR 25 .
E:1 NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBIO | 5425 NOBID | $15.20 | NOBID | MOBID,
921080 |Pol Holdes, Pan Handler wistrap, pair PAR 300 :
red I B . S NOBID NOBIO | NOBID | NOBID| 33,84 $1.30°_ | NOBIO| NOBID | NOBID
921100 | Utensils, Forks, H.D., Clear, 1000/cs, ek CASE' 100
- B MO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $14.55° $13.99(n) | 52058 | NOBID , NOBID
921110 |Utensils, Knives, H.O. Clear, 1000/cs. **  |casE 15
79 NO BID NOBIO | NOBID | NOBID | _$14.55" $13.90(n) | 52063 , NOBIO | NOBID
921120 |Utensits, Sch Kits, Lt Wt Spork, Straw, Napkin, Wk CASE 5800
8| 100d7cs. 7 NO BID si0.01* | NoBID | NoBIDD  $10.70 $14.50 | 52200 | NOBID | $10.31
921125 |Utensifs, Spoons, Soup, H.D., Clear 1000/cs. *% |ease 10
81 . NO BIiD NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |  $14.55 $13.98(a) | 52063 | nOBID | NOBID |
921130 |Utensils, Spoons, H.D,, Clear, 1000/cs. *%  |CASE 10
82 : NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $14.55 $13.00(8) | $20.63 | NOBID | NOBID
931025 |Cup, Soup, 12 az combo with lid, paper, 250/cs **%  [cacE 10
83 PRINTED WITH “Hearty Soup” __NOBID__{ NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID| $30.25° NOBID ! NOBID| NOBID ; NOBID_
931030 |Cup, Soup, 16 oz combo with kid, paper, 250/cs *k  oacE 5
B4 PRINTED WITH “Hearty Soup™ s NO BID NOBID | NOBID ; NOBID| $3725* | NOBID |NOBID] NOBID | NOBID |
931040 |Piats, 9" Black, 500/cs CASE 500
85 s NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | 52195 $31.42 $33.52 | NOBID | NOBID
931045 |Plate, 9" 3-comp, Black, 500/cs *k CASEE 130
86 NQ BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $22.45* 4374 NOBIO} NOBID | NOBID_|
931050 |Utensits, Knive, Black H.D, 1000/case *% loacp 20
a7 3 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |  $1745" $13.8%(s) | $17.56 | NOBID | NOBID |
931055 |Ulensils, Soup Spoors, Black H.D, 1000/zase *%  |cAsE 5
NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $17.45" $13.08(8) | 52608 | NOBID | NOBID
931060 |Utensils, Farks, Black H.D 1000/cs *% |casE 1000 514,18 (2 Pallet T
88 . Miny {a) NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $15.05° $13.98(0) _ 1426 (a)] NOBID | NOBID
931065 |Utensils, Spoons, Btack, H.D. 1000/cs *%  |CASE 1s !
90 | NO BID noBin | NOBID | NOBID]  $17.45° $13.99(n)_($14.28(a), NOBID | No®id |
*Denoctes low bid
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